P-CARD PURCHASE REQUISITION FORM
TODAY'S DATE DATE NEEDED MANAGER NAME FY DEPT. DIVISION DIVISION #
11/6/2020 Gary Bonkowski 2 D210 Logist & Warehouse 2180
Il. PROCUREMENT
VENDOR NAME [TEM OR SERVICE REQUESTED
Enterprise Rental Car Damage
FUND AGENCY UNIT ACTIVITY APPROP OBJECT CODE TOTAL ($)
LINE1 100 D210 2180 ELEC ELE1 8201 $ 2,517.40
LINE2
LINE3
$ 2,517.40
P-CARD (NC)
NV
LaQ
BidSync #
SS
CL
PROCURER SIGNATURE DATE RECONCILED SIGNATURE DATE
j Rovenback 11/6/2020
BUDGET SIGNATURE DATE
Diaitallv sianed by Berta Ramirez

/guj; W Date: 2020.11.09 10:41:41 -07'00'

Form Revised 8/22/19



One Time Payment

https://collectpay.princetonecom.com/otp/submitCreditCardPaymentVeri...

—=nterprise

1of1

Payment Information

JOHN BOLLINGER MARICOPA COUNTY g Print
ELECTIONS | Billing Invoice #: 3004757517

Payment Confirmation

Your payment has been authorized.

Please print this page for your records.

Remit Information

Claim Number:

Unit Number:

Personal Information

Credit Card Type:
Name on Credit Card:
Credit Card Address 1:
Credit Card Address 2:
City:

State:

Zip:

Payment Information

Created:

Credit Card Number:

Credit Card Expiration Date:
Payment Date:

Amount:

Total Amount:

Confirmation Number:

Email Address:

16200322
7SJF56

Visa
Joseph Rodenback

111 8. 3rd Ave.

Phoenix
AZ

85003

Fri Nov 6 2020 13:53:32

Bttty ST Rl VISA

01/2023
11/06/2020

$2,517.40

$2,517.40
754792293

jrodenback@risc.maricopa.gov

Exit

©2020 Official Payments

View Payment History

11/6/2020, 11:53 AM



lofl
—=nterprise

rent-a-car
PO BOX 843369
KANSASCITY MO 64184
UNITED STATES

JOHN BOLLINGER MARICOPA COUNTY ELECTIONS

Unit Number
Claim Number
Date of Loss
Renter's name
Vehicle (YMM)
Billing Invoice

BALANCE DUE: $2517.40

10/22/2020

: 7SJF56

: 16200322

: 07/15/2020

: JOHN BOLLINGER MARICOPA

COUNTY ELECTIONS
: 2019-T1LC-FORD

: 3004757517

There remains a balance due in the amount shown above. Please remit payment in full within ten (10)
days to the address above and include our claim number on your payment. |f you prefer you may
also pay using a debit card, credit card or directly from your bank account at the following website:

http://www.claimtopay.com

If you have any questions, please contact the undersigned.

If you have any feedback regarding the handling of this claim please send an email to

ClaimFeedback@ehi.com.

Sincerely,
CODY HULTGREN
Phone: 866-300-3238 3949

Email : e192vd@erac.com



Joseph Rodenback - RISCX

From: Mayberry, Jared <Jared.Mayberry@ehi.com>

Sent: Friday, October 23, 2020 10:18 AM

To: Joseph Rodenback - RISCX

Subject: RE: Damage information related to claim # 16200322 with ENTERPRISE
Attachments: 1.png; 2.png

Joey,

Looks like there was damage to the passenger side rear rocker panel. It appears an Erwin Boyd signed for the damage.
Let me know if you need anything else.

Jared

From: Joseph Rodenback - RISCX <jrodenback@risc.maricopa.gov>

Sent: Friday, October 23, 2020 9:56 AM

To: Mayberry, Jared <Jared.Mayberry@ehi.com>

Subject: FW: Damage information related to claim # 16200322 with ENTERPRISE

Hi Jared,

Are you able to provide any information on this invoice we received for damage to a vehicle?
Thanks,

Joey Rodenback

Maricopa County Recorder/Elections
jrodenback@risc.maricopa.gov

From: Gary Bonkowski - RISCX <gbonkowski@risc.maricopa.gov>

Sent: Friday, October 23, 2020 7:51 AM

To: Joseph Rodenback - RISCX <jrodenback@risc.maricopa.gov>; Kayla Stewart - RISC <kstewart@risc.maricopa.gov>
Subject: FW: Damage information related to claim # 16200322 with ENTERPRISE

Joey,

This was sent to me and | don't have any information...

Let's discuss later, sorry but | don't have enough information.
From: CODY HULTGREN <el192vd@erac.com>

Sent: Thursday, October 22, 2020 10:42 PM

To: Gary Bonkowski - RISCX <gbonkowski@risc.maricopa.gov>
Subject: Damage information related to claim # 16200322 with ENTERPRISE

1



Please review the important documentation attached that is related to damage claim #16200322

IMPORTANT: This e-mail (including any attachments) is intended for the use of the individual or entity to which it is
addressed and may contain information that is classified, private, or confidential. If the reader of this message is not the
intended recipient, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering the message to the intended recipient, you are
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, or copying of this communication is prohibited. If you have received
this communication in error, please notify us immediately by replying to this e-mail and then deleting the email and
attachments. Thank you.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are intended solely for the use of the individual
or entity to whom they are addressed and may contain confidential and privileged information protected by law. If you
received this e-mail in error, any review, use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of the e-mail is strictly prohibited.
Please notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and delete all copies from your system.
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